
21-645-17 RN (08/27/2024) 

PURCHASING AGENDA ITEM 
Hernando County School District 

School Board Approval Meeting: August 27, 2024 

Bid No. 21-645-17 RN Bid Title:  Printing/Specialty Papers & 

Envelopes for Central Printing Services

Recommend approval of this agenda item under the specific category below: 

☐Lowest Bid(s) ☐Request for Proposal(s) ☐Low Bid(s) Meeting Specification ☐Rejection/Cancellation

☐Revised Award ☒Renewal of Contract ☐Sole Source ☐Re-Award (Partial/Whole)

☐Bid Termination ☐Revisions/Amendments to Bid ☐Bid Extension ☐Emergency

☐Piggyback Cooperative

Bid Contract Period: 08/25/2024 through 08/24/2025 ☐ N/A – One Time Purchase

Contract Type: ☐ Estimated ☐ Firm, Fixed ☒ Firm, Fixed ☐ Firm, Fixed Unit Prices,

Dollar Amount Dollar Amount Unit Prices Hourly Rates, Fees and/or

Percentages

Renewal Options: No. of Terms ☐ Length of ☐ Length of ☒ None

Remaining Each Term (month) Each Term (year)

Rationale/Reason: 

Bidders Electronically Bids Received: No Bids: Late Bids: Rejected Bids:    N/A – Bids Not 

Downloaded From Bidnet  Required: Renewal 

Direct Website: n/a

Submitted By: Christopher Reckner School(s):  District Wide 

Director of Purchasing & Warehousing 

Requested By: Genele Firlik  Department(s): School Distribution Center 

Manager of Warehouse,  

Property Control, Printing & Records 

Recommended award, description of items and prices: (See attached) 

T/C CODE: 2117 
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MAC Paper and Packing, INC. dba MAC Papers, LLC, EIN#84-4725239

Section I: Bond Offset and Cover Stock 

Item No. 
Minimum 
Order 

Item Description 
Mfr. Brand Name & 
No of Product Bid 

Quantity per 
Case 

Cost/M 

1. 1000 
CERTIFICATE BOND 
8.5” x 11”, 24# White 

068550-8.5 x 11, 24# 
Captial Bond, Lt. Cockle 

5000 $55.66 

2. 1000 
ACCENT OPAQUE DIGITAL 
11” X 17” 80# White, International – 
068613 Accent Opaque cover 

068613-17 x 11, 80# 
Accent Opaque Cover 

1000 $102.46 

3. 1000 
CLASSIC LINEN COVER, 
8.5  x 11,  80#,  Avon White 

060900-8.5 x 11, 80# 
CL. Linen Avon White

2000 $133.16 

4. 500 
CLASSIC LINEN COVER, 
18 x 12,  80#,  Avon White 

064775-18 x 12, 80#, 
CL Linen Avon White 

500 $404.80 

5. 2000 
CLASSIC LINEN COVER, 
11 x 17,  80#,  Monterey Sand 

044410-35 x 23, 80#, 
Classic Linen Monterey 
Sand 

2000 $411.13 

6. 500 
VELVET COVER, 11 x 17, White, 100#, 
MacGregor Plus or Equal 

N64743-17 x 11, 100# 
Blazer Digital Satin 
Cover 

500 $102.46 

7. 750 
GLOSS COVER, 11 x 17, White, 80#, Blazer 
Digital or Equal 

N64740-17 x 11, 80# 
Blazer Digital Gloss 
Cover 

750 $93.61 

8. 1500 
GLOSS TEXT, 11 x 17, White, 80#, Blazer 
Digital or Equal 

N64730-11 x 17, 80# 
Blazer Digital Gloss 
Text 

1500 $55.66 

9. 2000 
ROYAL SUNDANCE COVER, 8.5 x 11,  80#,  
Thyme (250 Sheets Per Ream) 

069087-8.5 x 11, 80# 
Royal Sundance Fiber 
Thyme  

2000 $113.85 

10. 500 
ROYAL SUNDANCE COVER 
044517 – 500/carton, 23” x 35” 80# 
Thyme 

044517-35 x  23, 80# 
Royal Sundance Thyme 

500 $936.10 

11. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 x 
17, White, 67 # 

063096-11 x 17, 67# 
Springhill Vellum 
Bristol, White 

1000 $70.84 

12. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 x 
17, Yellow, 
67 # 

063166-11 x 17, 67# 
Springhill Vellum 
Bristol, Yellow 

1000 $73.37 

13. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 x 
17, Blue, 67 # 

063099-11 x 17, 67# 
Springhill Vellum 
Bristol, Blue 

1000 $73.37 

14. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 x 
17, Pink, 67 # 

063102-11 x 17, 67# 
Springhill Vellum 
Bristol, Pink 

1000 $73.37 

15. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 x 
17, Green, 67 # 

063098-11 x 17, 67# 
Springhill Vellum 
Bristol, Green 

1000 $73.37 

16. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 x 
17, Bright Orange, 67 # 

064038-11 x 17, 65# 
Neenah, Astrobright 
Cosmic Orange 

1000 $126.50 

17. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 
x 17, Tan 67# 

065240-11 x 17, 67# 
Exact VB Tan 

1000 $74.65 
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Section I: Bond Offset and Cover Stock - CONTINUED 

Item No. 
Minimum 
Order 

Item Description 
Mfr. Brand Name & 
No of Product Bid 

Quantity per 
Case 

Cost/M 

18. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 
x 17, Bright Purple 65# 

064409--11 x 17,65# 
Astrobright cover 
Planetary Purple 

1000 $126.50 

19. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 
x 17, Bright Blue 65# 

064421--11 x 17,65# 
Astrobright cover 
Lunar Blue 

 
1000 

$126.50 

20. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 
x 17, Sunburst/Bright Yellow 65# 

064469--11 x 17,65# 
Astrobright cover 
Sunburst yellow 

 
1000 

$126.50 

21. n/a 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 
x 17, Bright Aqua 65# 

N/A 
 
N/A 

NO BID 

22. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 
x 17, Bright Pink 65# 

N64458--11 x 17, 65 
Astrobright cover 
Pulsar Pink 

 
1000 

$126.50 

23. 1000 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 
x 17, Bright Green 65# 

064438--11 x 17, 65# 
Astrobright cover 
Terra Green 

 
1000 

$126.50 

24. 

 
2000 

PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, 
COVER, 11 x 17, Eclipse Black 
80# 

046744-23 x 35 
80# Astrobright cover 
Eclipse Black 

500 $1,265.00 

25. 

 
1000 

PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, 
COVER, 11 x 17, Goldenrod 
67# 

063097, 11  X 17, 67# 
Springhill Goldenrod 1000 $73.37 

26. 

 
1000 

PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, COVER, 11 x 
17, 
Cream/Manila 67# 

063101-11 x 17,67# 
Springhill VB 
Cream 

 

 
1000 

$73.37 

27. 
 

500 

 
PAPER, VELLUM BRISTOL, 
COVER, 23 x 35, Lavender 67# 

072280--23 x 35,67# 
Exact VB 
Orchid 

 
500 

$442.75 

 

Percentage Discount for Balance of Manufacturer’s Line Items, Not Specifically Identified in Section(s)  

(Same Percentage Discount Applies, Regardless of Vendors Manufacturer’s Products Referenced):  NO BID  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



21-645-17 RN (08/27/2024)  4 

 

 

Section II: Parchments and Astrobrights 

Item No. 
Minimum 
Order 

Item Description 
Mfr. Brand Name & 
No of Product Bid 

Quantity per 
Case 

Cost/M 

28. 2000 

ASTROPARCHE PARCHMENT, 8.5 x 
11, 65# 
Cover Blue, Wausau or 
Equal 

067930-8.5 x 11, 65# 
Astroparche cover 
Blue 

2000 $88.55 

29. 2000 

ASTROPARCHE PARCHMENT, 
8.5 x 11, 
65# Cover Natural, 
Wausau or Equal 

067910-8.5 x 11, 65# 
Astroparche cover 
Natural 2000 $88.55 

30. 2000 

ASTROPARCHE PARCHMENT, 
8.5 x 11, 
65# Cover Aged, Wausau 
or Equal 

067980-8.5 x 11, 65# 
Astroparche cover 
Aged 2000 $88.55 

31. 2000 

ASTROPARCHE PARCHMENT, 8.5 
X 11, 
65# Cover Ancient Gold, Wausau or 
Equal 

067990-8.5 x 11, 65# 
Astroparche cover 
Ancient Gold 

2000 $88.55 

32. 2000 
ASTROPARCHE PARCHMENT, 8.5 
X 11, 
65# Cover Gray, Wausau or Equal 

067940-8.5 x 11,65# 
Astroparche cover 
Gray 

2000 $88.55 

33. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Re -Entry Red 

046350-23 x 35, 65# 
Astrobright cover 
Re-Entry Red 

500 $506.00 

34. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Celestial Blue 

046345-23 x 35, 65# 
Astrobright cover 
Celestial Blue 

500 $506.00 

35. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Vulcan Green 

 
500 $506.00 

36. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Terra Green 

 
500 $506.00 

37. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 
23 X 35, 65# 
Planetary Purple 

 
500 $506.00 

38. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Venus Violet 

 
500 $506.00 

39. n/a 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Neptune Blue 

 
n/a NO BID 

40. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Orbit Orange 

 

500 $506.00 
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Section II: Parchments and Astrobrights - CONTINUED 

Item No. 
Minimum 
Order 

Item Description 
Mfr. Brand Name & 
No of Product Bid 

Quantity per 
Case 

Cost/M 

41. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Solar Yellow 

 
500 $506.00 

42. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Pulsar Pink 

 
500 $506.00 

43. 500 
ASTROBRIGHTS COVER SMOOTH, 23 X 
35, 65# 
Galaxy Gold 

046300-23 x 35, 65# 
Astrobright cover 
Galaxy Gold 

500 $506.00 

44. 500 

ASTROPARCHE PARCHMENT TEXT, 
23 X 
35, 60# Text Ancient Gold, Wausau or 
Equal 

034300-23 x 35, 60# 
Astroparche text 
Ancient Gold 

1500 $351.67 

45. 750 
EARTHCHOICE COVER SMOOTH, Cream, 
Tag 046145 
– 23 x 35, 65#, Qty per Case 500 

046145--23 x 35, 65# 
Earthchoice cover 
Cream 

750 $379.50 

 

Percentage Discount for Balance of Manufacturer’s Line Items, Not Specifically Identified in Section(s)  

(Same Percentage Discount Applies, Regardless of Vendors Manufacturer’s Products Referenced):  NO BID  
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Section III: Gum Labels, Linens and Envelopes 

Item No. 
Minimum 
Order 

Item Description 
Mfr. Brand Name & 
No of Product Bid 

Quantity per 
Case 

Cost/M 

46. 100 
PRESSURE-SENSITIVE OFFSET, 8-
1/2 x 11, White, 
60 #, Fasson or Equal 

092455-8.5 x 11 
Starboard tack 
Uncoated label 

1000 $270.20 

47. 100 
PRESSURE-SENSITIVE 
OFFSET, 8-1/2 x 11, Fluorescent Pink, 60 
#, Fasson or Equal 

092486-8.5 x 11 
Starboard tack 
Fluorescent Pink 

1000 $364.35 

48. 1000 
PRESSURE-SENSITIVE 
OFFSET, 8-1/2 x 11, Fluorescent Green, 
60 #, Fasson or Equal 

092478, 8.5 x 11 
Starboard Tack 
Fluorescent 
Green 

1000 $364.35 

49. 100 

PRESSURE-SENSITIVE 
OFFSET, 8-1/2 x 11, Fluorescent Yellow, 
60 #, Fasson or Equal 

092496-8.5 x 11 
Starboard tack 
Solar Yellow 

1000 $364.35 

50. 100 

PRESSURE-SENSITIVE 
OFFSET, 8-1/2 x 11, Fluorescent Orange, 
60 #, Fasson or Equal 

092480-8.5 x 11 
Starboard tack 
Fluorescent 
Orange 

1000 $364.35 

51. 1000 
CLASSIC LINEN TEXT 
ENVELOPES, 
A-2, 70# Avon White 

080480-A-2 
Classic Linen 
Avon white 

1000 $171.00 

52. 1000 
CLASSIC SMOOTH TEXT 
ENVELOPES, 
A-2, 70# Avon White 

088110-A-2 
Classic Crest Avon 
White 

1000 $171.00 

53. 1000 
CLASSIC LINEN TEXT 
ENVELOPES, 
A-2, 24# Monterey Sand 

088700-A-2,70# 
Classic Linen 
Monterey Sand 

1000 $177.10 

54. 500 
CATALOG ENVELOPES, 9” x 
12”, White Side Seal, Self- 
Adhere 

087268-9 x 12, 28# 
Mac-a-Peel Catalog 

500 $171.00 

55. 500 
CATALOG ENVELOPES, 10” 
x 13”, White Side Seal, Self- 
Adhere 

087278--10 x 13, 28# 
Mac-A-Peel 
Catalog envelope 

500 $197.50 

56. 2500 

ENVELOPES, Plain Size # 10, White, 
500/box, Signet Brand or 
Equal 

083440--#10, 24# 
Mac regular 
envelope 

2500 $31.00 

57. 1000 

ANNOUNCEMENT 
ENVELOPES, 
A-6, 28#, White, ENV FSC Mix 
50% (PCW 10), Waverly Hall or Equal 

087426--A-6, 70# 
White Waverly 
Hall envelope 

1000 $96.15 

58. 1000 
WINDOW ENVELOPES, 
Left #10 – 083450, 2,500/carton, 
#10 Digimac only 

#0, 24# Digimac 
Window envelopes 2500 $85.00 

 

Percentage Discount for Balance of Manufacturer’s Line Items, Not Specifically Identified in Section(s)  

(Same Percentage Discount Applies, Regardless of Vendors Manufacturer’s Products Referenced):  NO BID  
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Section IV: Carbonless Paper Stock 

Item No. 
Minimum 
Order 

Item Description 
Mfr. Brand Name & 
No of Product Bid 

Quantity per 
Case 

Cost/M 

59. 5000 
CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED REVERSE 
8.5 x 11 2-Part W/Y 
Glatfelter Excel One Only 

051306-8.5 x 11 

2-part reverse 
5000 $39.20 

60. 5000 
CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED REVERSE 
8.5 x 14 2-Part W/Y 
Glatfelter Excel One Only 

051349-8.5 x 14 

2-part reverse 
5000 $51.74 

61. 5000 
CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED REVERSE 
8.5 x 14 3-Part W/Y/P 
Glatfelter Excel One Only 

051351-8.5 x 14 

3-part Reverse 
5000 $57.68 

62. 5000 
CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED REVERSE 
8.5 x 11 3-Part W/Y/P 
Glatfelter Excel One Only 

051314-8.5 x 11 

3-part Reverse 
5000 $47.60 

63. 5000 

CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED 
FORWARD 
8.5 x 11 3-Part W/Y/P 
Glatfelter Excel One Only 

051316-8.5 x 11 

3-part Forward 
5000 $47.60 

64. 5000 
CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED REVERSE 
8.5 x 14 4-Part W/Y/P/Gold 
Glatfelter Excel One Only 

051356-8.5 x 14 

4-part reverse 
5000 $62.72 

65. 5000 
CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED REVERSE 
8.5 x 11 4-Part W/Y/P/Gold 
Glatfelter Excel One Only 

051325-8.5 x 11 

4-part reverse 
5000 $50.40 

66. 5000 

CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED 
FORWARD 
8.5 x 11 4-Part W/Y/P/Gold 
Glatfelter Excel One Only 

051357-8.5 x 11, 

4-part forward 
5000 $50.40 

67. 5000 
CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED REVERSE 
8.5 x 11 5-Part W/Y/P/Gold 
Glatfelter Excel One Only 

051366-8.5 x 11 

5-part reverse 
5000 $63.84 

68. n/a 
CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED REVERSE 
8.5 x 11   5-Part W/Y/P/Gold 
Glatfelter Excelerator Only 

 
n/a 

 NO BID 

69. 5000 

CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED 3-PART 
FORWARD 050823 – 8.5” X 
14” Glatfelter 

Glatfelter Excel One only. 

051352-8.5 x 14 

3-part forward 
5000 $57.68 

70. 5000 

CARBONLESS PRECOLLATED 4-PART 
FORWARD – 050862 8.5” x 
11” Glatfelter 
Glatfelter Excel One Only. 

051326-8.5 x 11 

4-part forward 
5000 $62.72 

71. 1 Case 
NCR GLUE 
109890 – HAR fan apart (for carbonless 
padding) 

109890-HAR 
fan apart glue 
gallons 

4 Gallon/Case $679.84/Case 

 

Percentage Discount for Balance of Manufacturer’s Line Items, Not Specifically Identified in Section(s)  

(Same Percentage Discount Applies, Regardless of Vendors Manufacturer’s Products Referenced):  NO BID  
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Section V: Miscellaneous Stock 

Item No. 
Minimum 
Order 

Item Description 
Mfr. Brand Name & 
No of Product Bid 

Quantity per 
Case 

Cost/M 

72. 4000 
COLOR COPY PAPER 
8.5 X 11 28# Smooth 
Photo White, Hammermill or Equal 

066221-8.5 x 11, 28# 
Hammermill Color 
Copy 

4000 $36.30 

73. 2000 
COLOR COPY PAPER 
11 X 17 32# Smooth 
Photo White, Hammermill or Equal 

066230-11 x 17, 32# 
Hammermill 
Color copy 

2000 $72.60 

74. 4000 
COLOR COPY PAPER 
8.5 x 11, 32# Smooth, Photo White, 
Hammermill or Equal 

066233-8.5 x 11, 32# 

Hammermill 
4000 $49.10 

75. 5000 
BOND BRIGHT WHITE 
8.5 X 11, 24# Cockle, Capital or Equal 

068550-8.5x 11, 24# 

Capital Bond 
5000 $58.00 

76. 2000 
CLASSIC LINEN COVER 
8.5 X 11, 80# Avon White 

060900-8.5 x 11, 80# 
Cl Linen Avon 

2000 $139.00 

77. 5000 
ROYAL FIBER WRITING 
8.5 X 11, 24# Smooth Gray 

064575-8.5 x 11, 24# 
Royal Fiber Gray 

5000 $45.00 

78. 5000 
ROYAL FIBER WRITING, 
8.5 x 11, 24#, Monterey Sand 

060760-8.5 x 11, 24# 
Cl. Linen Monterey 
Sand 

5000 $46.20 

79. n/a 
ROYAL FIBER WRITING, 
8.5 x 11, 24#, Thyme N/A 

n/a NO BID 

80. 250 
 KAN’T KOPY, VOID BLUE, 
8.5 x 11, 60#, 100 Sheets Per Pack 

102000-8.5 x 11, 24# 

Kant Kopy 
2500 $119.00 

 

Percentage Discount for Balance of Manufacturer’s Line Items, Not Specifically Identified in Section(s)  

(Same Percentage Discount Applies, Regardless of Vendors Manufacturer’s Products Referenced):  NO BID 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 


